OFFICIAL ABSTRACT

US ARMY, CORPS OF ENGINEERS - MEMPHIS DISTRICT ABSTRACT OF BIDS

INVITATION NO.: DACW66-01-B-0002 GOVT. ESTIMATE BIDDER #1 : BIDDER #2 ~
TITLE: Lease of One Cutterhead, Hydraulic, Pipeline Dredge, MEMPHIS Pentzien, Inc. Carter Construction
Fully Operated with Attendant Plant & Snagging Equipment, DISTRICT 6969 Grover St. Company, Inc.
White River, Arkansas COST Omaha, Nebraska P.O. Box 2530
BID OPENING DATE AND TIME: 03/13/01 1430 ENGINEERING 68106 Benton, AR 72018
SMALL BUSINESS DETERMINATION: SBSA (Without Profit) Small Business Small Business
NUMBER OF AMENDMENTS: None UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED

NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY] U/M | PRICE | AMOUNT | PRICE|{ AMOUNT | PRICE| AMOUNT

BASE YEAR LOT ONE BID

0001 |Lease of one fully operated
hydraulic dredge with 18-inch ID
pump discharge and attendant
dredge plant, including pipeline,
survey boat, and technical

equipment.
0001AA|First 2,000 hours 2000 HR | certify that all bids
0001AB |All over 2,000 hours 1438 HR received in response to
0002 |Lease of Snagging Equipment this solicitation have
0002AA|First 1,000 hours 1000 HR been opened, read and
0002AB |All over 1,000 hours 719 HR recorded on this
0003 |Mobilization and Demobilization 1 JB XXX XXX XXX abstract.
TOTAL BASE YEAR LOT ONE BID No Bid No Bid No Bid %
BASE YEAR LOT TWO BID Wendell N. Norman
0004 |Lease of one fully operated Bid Opening Officer

hydraulic dredge with 20-inch D
pump discharge and attendant
dredge plant, including pipeline,
survey boat, and technical

equipment.

0004AA Fiqrstp1,750 hours 1750 HR | 537.00 | 939,750.00 | 588.00 | 1,029,000.00 | 420.00 { 735,000.00
0004AB |All over 1,750 hours 1000 HR | 536.86 | 536,860.00 | 588.00 | 588,000.00 | 420.00 | 420,000.00

0005 [Lease of Snagging Equipment
0005AA |First 875 hours 875 HR | 259.48 | 227,045.00 | 163.00 | 142,625.00 | 160.00 | 140,000.00
0005AB |All over 875 hours 500 HR | 259.48 | 129,740.00 | 163.00 81,500.00 | 150.00 75,000.00
0006 |Mobilization and Demobilization 1 JB XXX 92,128.00 | XXX 127,800.00 | XXX 72,200.00
TOTAL BASE YEAR LOT TWO BID $1,925,523.00 $1,968,925.00 $1,442,200.00
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OFFICIAL ABSTRACT

US ARMY, CORPS OF ENGINEERS - MEMPHIS DISTRICT ABSTRACT OF BIDS
INVITATION NO.: DACW66-01-B-0002 GOVT. ESTIMATE BIDDER #1 BIDDER #2
TITLE: Lease of One Cutterhead, Hydraulic, Pipeline Dredge, MEMPHIS Pentzien, Inc. Carter Construction
Fully Operated with Attendant Plant & Snagging Equipment, DISTRICT 6969 Grover St. Company, Inc.
White River, Arkansas COST Omaha, Nebraska P.O. Box 2530
BID OPENING DATE AND TIME: 03/13/01 1430 ENGINEERING 68106 Benton, AR 72018
SMALL BUSINESS DETERMINATION: SBSA (Without Profit) Small Business Small Business
NUMBER OF AMENDMENTS: None UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY] UM | PRICE | AMOUNT | PRICE| AMOUNT | PRICE| AMOUNT
OPTION YEAR LOT ONE BID
0007 |Lease of one fully operated
hydraulic dredge with 18-inch ID
pump discharge and attendant
dredge plant, including pipeline,
survey boat, and technical
equipment.
0007AA|First 2,000 hours 2000 HR
0007AB|All over 2,000 hours 1438 HR
0008 |Lease of Snagging Equipment
0008AA|First 1,000 hours 1000 HR
0008AB |All over 1,000 hours 719 HR
0009 [Mobilization and Demobilization 1 JB XXX XXX XXX
TOTAL OPTION YEAR LOT ONE BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
OPTION YEAR LOT TWO BID
0010 |[Lease of one fully operated
hydrautic dredge with 20-inch ID
pump discharge and attendant
dredge plant, including pipeline,
survey boat, and technical
equipment.
0010AA |First 1,750 hours 1750 HR | 553.11 | 967,942.50 | 588.00 {1,029,000.00 | 435.00 | 761,250.00
0010AB |All over 1,750 hours 1000 HR | 552.96 | 552,960.00 | 588.00 { 588,000.00 | 435.00 | 435,000.00
0011 |[Lease of Snagging Equipment
0011AA |First 875 hours 875 HR | 267.27 | 233,861.25|163.00| 142,625.00 | 165.00 | 144,375.00
0011AB |All over 875 hours 500 HR | 267.26 | 133,630.00 | 163.00 81,500.00 | 160.00 80,000.00
0012 [Mobilization and Demobilization 1 JB XXX 94,892.00 ] XXX 127,800.00 | XXX 69,600.00
TOTAL OPTION YEAR LOT TWO BID $1,983,285.75 $1,968,925.00 $1,490,225.00
TOTAL BASE & OPTION YRS >> $3,908,808.75 $3,937,850.00 $2,932,425.00
VARIATION FROM GOVT. EST. >> 0.74% -24.98%
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